



**MONROE TOWNSHIP, CUMBERLAND COUNTY
LAWN CARE & MAINTENANCE REBID RESULTS**

April 12, 2017

Bidder	Ltr	Ins	Qst	Cert	NCA	PB*	Description	REBID	REBID	REBID
								Total Annual Contract	1st Yr Renewal	2nd Yr Renewal
1 Lawn Butler 275 Cumberland Parkway Ste 248 Mechanicsburg, PA 17055 Phone: 717-823-3900 Rick Krout	√	√	√	√	√		Lawn mowing Trimming Edging Total	\$ 28,000.00 Included Included \$ 28,000.00	\$ 28,560.00 Included Included \$ 28,560.00	\$ 29,120.00 Included Included \$ 29,120.00
2 Brown's Lawn Care LLC 381 North Locust Point Road Mechanicsburg, PA 17050 Phone: 717-580-6303 James S. Brown	√	√	√	√	√		Lawn mowing Trimming Edging Total	\$ 28,392.00 \$ 1,344.00 \$ 1,344.00 \$ 31,080.00	\$ 31,220.00 \$ 1,484.00 \$ 1,484.00 \$ 34,188.00	\$ 34,356.00 \$ 1,624.00 \$ 1,624.00 \$ 37,604.00
3 1st Impression Landscaping 1521 Commerce Avenue Carlisle, PA 17015 Phone: 717-579-8295 Shawn Liberator	√	√	√	√	√		Lawn mowing Trimming Edging Total	\$ 35,000.00 Included Included \$ 35,000.00	\$ 35,000.00 Included Included \$ 35,000.00	\$ 35,000.00 Included Included \$ 35,000.00
4 Green With Envy Landscape LLV 1146 Boiling Springs Road Mechanicsburg, PA 17055 Phone: 717-590-7056 Jeffrey Moyer	√	√	√	√	√		Lawn mowing Trimming Edging Total	\$ 47,460.00 Included Included \$ 47,460.00	\$ 47,460.00 Included Included \$ 47,460.00	\$ 50,260.00 Included Included \$ 50,260.00
5 TwentyTree Lawn & Land 3425 Peters Mountain Road Front Halifax, PA 17032 Phone: 717-827-3300	√	√	√	√	√		Lawn mowing Trimming Edging Total	\$ 70,840.00 Included Included \$ 70,840.00	\$ 72,240.00 Included Included \$ 72,240.00	\$ 73,640.00 Included Included \$ 73,640.00
6 A&M Lawn Care 160 Glenwood Road Dillsburg PA 17019 Phone: 717-991-9583							Lawn mowing Trimming Edging Total	NO BID \$ -	NO BID \$ -	NO BID \$ -
7 A Touch of Green, LLC. 3 Browning Lane Carlisle, PA 17015 Phone: 717-241-0096							Lawn mowing Trimming Edging Total	NO BID \$ -	NO BID \$ -	NO BID \$ -
8 Brent's Lawncare 245 Pine Road Mt. Holly Springs, PA 17065 Phone: 717-226-3044							Lawn mowing Trimming Edging Total	NO BID \$ -	NO BID \$ -	NO BID \$ -
9 Fares Farhat General Construction LLC 5 Pheasant Hill Drive Halifax, PA 17032 Phone: 717-439-1726							Lawn mowing Trimming Edging Total	NO BID \$ -	NO BID \$ -	NO BID \$ -
10 AG 2 Enterprises 150 Franklintown Road Dillsburg, PA 17019 Phone: 717-599-9093							Lawn mowing Trimming Edging Total	NO BID \$ -	NO BID \$ -	NO BID \$ -



**MONROE TOWNSHIP, CUMBERLAND COUNTY
LAWN CARE & MAINTENANCE REBID RESULTS**

April 12, 2017

Bidder	Ltr	Ins	Qst	Cert	NCA	PB*	Description	REBID	REBID	REBID
								Total Annual Contract	1st Yr Renewal	2nd Yr Renewal

Ltr - Cover Letter
 Ins - Insurance Coverage
 Qst - Questionnaire
 Cert - Conflict / Disclosure Certificate
 NCA - Non Collusion Affidavit
 PB - Performance Bond (Winning Bid Only)*